
Q-24-786
VMware/ Infrastructure 

Production Support Subscription Renewal

Item 
No.  Item Description Unit of 

Measure Qty. Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Unit Price

1
VMware Support and Subscription Production
8 Processors Technical Support -
for VMware Infrastructure Acceleration Kit 
VI-AK-P-SSSC, (License # 5019209)

Ea. 1 $0.00 $330.08 * $186,165.12 *

2

VMware Support and Subscription Production
8 Processors Technical support - for VMware Infrastructure 
Acceleration Kit
VI-AK-P-SSSC, (License # 10066142)

Ea. 1 $0.00 $124.72 * $70,342.08 *

3

VMware Support and Subscription Production
Technical support 
VS7-ENT-PSSS-C
(Licesnse #0M41K-0Q3EH-180GN-0P984-89MMJ)

Ea. 8 $0.00 $46.19 * $26,051.16 *

4

VMware vSphere Enterprise Edition Plus
VS7-ENT-EPL-UG-C
(License # MN281-8T345-N81G0-06CK2-81AMJ) Ea. 8 $0.00 No Bid No Bid

*

Remarks/Exceptions:
En-Net Services, Inc. Non-Responsive - Breakdown of Pricing not included on Form of Proposal 
Delivery/Service can be performed no later than 30 calendar days from reciept of order.
The products being requested were rolled ino a single sku offering by Broadcom. Therefore, En-Net's quote does not match the lines on the bid sheet. 
However, the pricing is correct.
STATEMENT OF WORK - on next page

TOTAL LUMP SUM (Item Nos. 1 through 4 above)

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

En-Net Services, LLC
Frederick, MD

HARD COPY QUOTE

$68,836.20 

GovConnection, Inc. dba
Connection - Public Sector Solutions

Merrimack, NH
HARD COPY QUOTE

$282,558.36 

1
Quotes Opened: June 20, 2024



Q-24-786 
VMware/ Infrastructure 

Production Support Subscription Renewal

Item 
No.  Item Description Unit of 

Measure Qty. Unit Price Total Price

1

VMware Support and Subscription Production
8 Processors Technical Support -
for VMware Infrastructure Acceleration Kit 
VI-AK-P-SSSC, (License # 5019209)

Ea. 1 $330.08 $190,126.08 *

2

VMware Support and Subscription Production
8 Processors Technical support - for VMware Infrastructure 
Acceleration Kit
VI-AK-P-SSSC, (License # 10066142)

Ea. 1 $124.72 $71,838.72 *

3

VMware Support and Subscription Production
Technical support 
VS7-ENT-PSSS-C
(Licesnse #0M41K-0Q3EH-180GN-0P984-89MMJ)

Ea. 8 $46.19 $26,605.44 *

4

VMware vSphere Enterprise Edition Plus
VS7-ENT-EPL-UG-C
(License # MN281-8T345-N81G0-06CK2-81AMJ) Ea. 8 No Bid No Bid

*

Remarks/Exceptions:
GovConnection, Inc. dba Connection - Public Sector Solutions Non-Responsive - Manipulated the Form of Propsal on 
both hard copy and electronic.
Delivery/Service can be performed no later than 14 calendar days from reciept of order.

TOTAL LUMP SUM (Item Nos. 1 through 4 above) $288,570.24 

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

GovConnection, Inc. dba
Connection - Public Sector Solutions

Merrimack, NH
VIRTUAL QUOTE

2
Quotes Opened: June 20, 2024



Q-24-786
VMware/ Infrastructure 

Production Support Subscription Renewal

En-Net Services, LLC

GovConnection Inc. dba Connection - Public Sector Solutions

1
Quotes Opened: June 20, 2024
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