Q-24-785

Aggregate / Emulsion Materials for Washington County Departments

C.William Hetzer, Inc. Craig Paving, Inc.
Hagerstown, MD Hagerstown, MD
VIRTUAL QUOTE VIRTUAL QUOTE
Item No. Product Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit
1 #57- Stone (1/2” - 1-1/2”) AASHTO 57 Ton $19.00 No Bid
2 #67 — Stone (3/4” or smaller) AASHTO 67 Ton $19.00 No Bid
3 #1 Rip Rap (97— 18”) RS Ton No Bid No Bid
4 #2 Rip Rap (12”7 —24”) R6 Ton No Bid No Bid
5 B-10 Stone B10 Ton $21.00 No Bid
6 CCR 3/4” Clean Crusher Run 3/4” Ton No Bid No Bid
7 CCR 3-1/2” Clean Crusher Run 3-1/2” Ton No Bid No Bid
8 DCR /RC6 Dirty Crusher Run Ton No Bid $7.50
9 CR6M Clean Crusher Run Ton No Bid No Bid
10 Gabion Stone (47— 77) AASHTO 89 Ton No Bid No Bid
11 MD 1 - Stone (2”7 —47) AASHTO 1 Ton No Bid No Bid
12 Dust AASHTO 10 Ton $20.00 No Bid
13 MD 2 Stone (17— 3”) AASHTO 2 Ton No Bid No Bid
14 MD 4 Stone (1/4” —3/4”) AASHTO 7 Ton $19.00 No Bid
15 25.0 mm Base Mix — Course Ton $55.00 $58.00
16 19.0 mm Base Mix — Fine Ton $59.00 $63.00
17 Cold Mix Year-Round Application Use Ton $150.00 No Bid
18A  |CRS2 Emulsion Gal No Bid No Bid
18B CSS - 1H Tack Oil (5 Gallon Pail) Pail No Bid No Bid
19 SS-1H Tack Oil (5 Gallon Pail) Pail No Bid No Bid
20 CSS-1H Tack Oil Gal No Bid No Bid
21 DW 9.5 mm Driveway Mix Ton $79.00 No Bid
22 PF - 14.75 mm Surface Fine (Dust) Ton No Bid No Bid
23 4.75 mm Sand Mix / Surface Top Ton $81.00 $82.50
24 SC 12.5 mm Surface Mix Course Ton $66.00 $60.00
25 9.5 mm Surface Mix Fine Ton $69.00 $67.50

Quotes Opened: 7/10/2024



Q-24-785

Aggregate / Emulsion Materials for Washington County Departments

C.William Hetzer, Inc. Craig Paving, Inc.
Hagerstown, MD Hagerstown, MD
VIRTUAL QUOTE VIRTUAL QUOTE
Item No. Product Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit

Licking Creek (Western Section) Ton/

26A Anti-Skid 9659 National Pike Delivered No Bid No Bid
Big Pool, MD 21711
Scenic Route #40

ot (Salt Dome West of Hancock Ton / . .

26B Anti-Skid Route 144 ) Delivered No Bid No Bid
Hancock, MD 21750
Northern Avenue (Central Section) Ton/

26C Anti-Skid 601 Northern Avenue Delivered No Bid No Bid
Hagerstown, MD 21742
Keedysville (Southern Section) Ton/

26D Anti-Skid 6223 Coffman Farm Road Delivered No Bid No Bid
Keedysville, MD 21756
Greensburg (Eastern Section) Ton/

26E Anti-Skid 13230 Greensburg Road Delivered No Bid No Bid
Smithsburg, MD 21783
Solid Waste (Forty West Landfill) Ton/

26F Anti-Skid 12630 Earth Care Road Delivered No Bid No Bid
Hagerstown, MD 21740

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

Remarks/Exceptions:

C. William Hetzer, Inc. - No Delivery / Service calendar days listed

Haul / Delivery rate schedule attached

Craig Paving, Inc. - No Delivery / Service calendar days listed

Haul / Delivery rate schedule not given

Quotes Opened: 7/10/2024



Q-24-785

Aggregate / Emulsion Materials for Washington County Departments

Martin Marietta P & W Excavating, Inc.
Williamsport, MD McConnellsburg, PA
HARD COPY QUOTE VIRTUAL QUOTE
Item No. Product Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit
1 #57- Stone (1/2” - 1-1/2”) AASHTO 57 Ton $17.85 No Bid
2 #67 — Stone (3/4” or smaller) AASHTO 67 Ton $17.95 No Bid
3 #1 Rip Rap (97— 18”) R5 Ton $27.50 No Bid
4 #2 Rip Rap (12”7 —24”) R6 Ton $27.50 No Bid
5 B-10 Stone B10 Ton $18.10 No Bid
6 CCR 3/4” Clean Crusher Run 3/4” Ton $11.50 No Bid
7 CCR 3-1/2” Clean Crusher Run 3-1/2” Ton $11.45 No Bid
8 DCR /RC6 Dirty Crusher Run Ton $8.10 No Bid
9 CR6M Clean Crusher Run Ton $11.05 No Bid
10 Gabion Stone (4”7 —77) AASHTO 89 Ton $23.15 No Bid
11 MD 1 - Stone (2”7 —4”) AASHTO 1 Ton No Bid No Bid
12 Dust AASHTO 10 Ton $16.25 No Bid
13 MD 2 Stone (1”7 —3") AASHTO 2 Ton $17.85 No Bid
14 MD 4 Stone (1/4” —3/4”) AASHTO 7 Ton $18.25 No Bid
15 25.0 mm Base Mix — Course Ton No Bid $71.90
16 19.0 mm Base Mix — Fine Ton No Bid $69.80
17 Cold Mix Year-Round Application Use Ton No Bid No Bid
18A  |CRS2 Emulsion Gal No Bid No Bid
18B CSS-1H Tack Oil (5 Gallon Pail) Pail No Bid No Bid
19 SS - 1H Tack Oil (5 Gallon Pail) Pail No Bid No Bid
20 CSS-1H Tack Oil Gal No Bid No Bid
21 DW 9.5 mm Driveway Mix Ton No Bid $77.90
22 PF - 14.75 mm Surface Fine (Dust) Ton No Bid No Bid
23 4.75 mm Sand Mix / Surface Top Ton No Bid No Bid
24 SC 12.5 mm Surface Mix Course Ton No Bid $76.50
25 9.5 mm Surface Mix Fine Ton No Bid $79.35

Quotes Opened: 7/10/2024



Q-24-785

Aggregate / Emulsion Materials for Washington County Departments

Martin Marietta P & W Excavating, Inc.
Williamsport, MD McConnellsburg, PA
VIRTUAL QUOTE
Item No. Product Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit

Licking Creek (Western Section) Ton/

26A Anti-Skid 9659 National Pike Delivered $23.60 No Bid
Big Pool, MD 21711
Scenic Route #40

. QL (Salt Dome West of Hancock) Ton/ .

268 | Anti-Skid Route 144 Delivered $23.60 No Bid
Hancock, MD 21750
Northern Avenue (Central Section) Ton/

26C Anti-Skid 601 Northern Avenue Delivered $23.60 No Bid
Hagerstown, MD 21742
Keedysville (Southern Section) Ton/

26D Anti-Skid 6223 Coffman Farm Road Delivered $24.40 No Bid
Keedysville, MD 21756
Greensburg (Eastern Section) Ton/

26E Anti-Skid 13230 Greensburg Road Delivered $24.40 No Bid
Smithsburg, MD 21783
Solid Waste (Forty West Landfill) Ton/

26F Anti-Skid 12630 Earth Care Road Delivered $23.60 No Bid
Hagerstown, MD 21740

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

Remarks/Exceptions:
Martin Marietta - No Delivery / Service calendar days listed

Haul / Delivery rate schedule and Fuel surcharge policy attached
Item Nos. 26A thru 26F - Pinesburg Quarry

P & W Excavating, Inc. - No Delivery / Service calendar days listed

Haul / Delivery rate schedule not given

Quotes Opened: 7/10/2024



Aggregate / Emulsion Materials for Washington County Departments

Q-24-785

Russell Standard Corp. Seaboard Asphalt Products Company
Pittsburg, PA Baltimore, MD
VIRTUAL QUOTE HARD COPY QUOTE
Item No. Product Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit
1 #57- Stone (1/2” — 1-1/2”) AASHTO 57 Ton No Bid No Bid
2 #67 — Stone (3/4” or smaller) AASHTO 67 Ton No Bid No Bid
3 #1 Rip Rap (97— 18”) RS Ton No Bid No Bid
4 #2 Rip Rap (12”7 —24”) R6 Ton No Bid No Bid
5 B-10 Stone B10 Ton No Bid No Bid
6 CCR 3/4” Clean Crusher Run 3/4” Ton No Bid No Bid
7 CCR 3-1/2” Clean Crusher Run 3-1/2” Ton No Bid No Bid
8 DCR /RC6 Dirty Crusher Run Ton No Bid No Bid
9 CR6M Clean Crusher Run Ton No Bid No Bid
10 Gabion Stone (4”7 —7”) AASHTO 89 Ton No Bid No Bid
11 MD 1 - Stone (2”7 —47) AASHTO 1 Ton No Bid No Bid
12 Dust AASHTO 10 Ton No Bid No Bid
13 MD 2 Stone (17 —3”) AASHTO 2 Ton No Bid No Bid
14 MD 4 Stone (1/4” —3/4”) AASHTO 7 Ton No Bid No Bid
15 25.0 mm Base Mix — Course Ton No Bid No Bid
16 19.0 mm Base Mix — Fine Ton No Bid No Bid
17 Cold Mix Year-Round Application Use Ton No Bid $141.25
18A  |CRS2 Emulsion Gal $2.58 No Bid
18B CSS - 1H Tack Oil (5 Gallon Pail) Pail No Bid No Bid
19 SS-1H Tack Oil (5 Gallon Pail) Pail No Bid $33.41
20 CSS-1H Tack Oil Gal $2.99 No Bid
21 DW 9.5 mm Driveway Mix Ton No Bid No Bid
22 PF - 14.75 mm Surface Fine (Dust) Ton No Bid No Bid
23 4.75 mm Sand Mix / Surface Top Ton No Bid No Bid
24 SC 12.5 mm Surface Mix Course Ton No Bid No Bid
25 9.5 mm Surface Mix Fine Ton No Bid No Bid

Quotes Opened: 7/10/2024



Q-24-785
Aggregate / Emulsion Materials for Washington County Departments

Russell Stanflard Corp. Seaboard Asphalt Products Company
Fayetteville, PA Baltimore. MD
VIRTUAL QUOTE ’
Item No. Product Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit

Licking Creek (Western Section) Ton/

26A Anti-Skid 9659 National Pike Delivered No Bid No Bid
Big Pool, MD 21711
Scenic Route #40

ot (Salt Dome West of Hancock Ton/ . .

26B Anti-Skid Route 144 ) Delivered No Bid No Bid
Hancock, MD 21750
Northern Avenue (Central Section) Ton/

26C Anti-Skid 601 Northern Avenue Delivered No Bid No Bid
Hagerstown, MD 21742
Keedysville (Southern Section) Ton/

26D Anti-Skid 6223 Coffman Farm Road Delivered No Bid No Bid
Keedysville, MD 21756
Greensburg (Eastern Section) Ton/

26E Anti-Skid 13230 Greensburg Road Delivered No Bid No Bid
Smithsburg, MD 21783
Solid Waste (Forty West Landfill) Ton/

26F Anti-Skid 12630 Earth Care Road Delivered No Bid No Bid
Hagerstown, MD 21740

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

Remarks/Exceptions:
Russell Standard - No Delivery / Service calendar days listed

Haul / Delivery rate schedule not given
Item Nos. 18A & 20 price by the gallon
Seaboard Asphalt Products Company - Delivery / Service can be performed no later than 7 calendar days from receipt of order.

Haul / Delivery rate schedule attached

Quotes Opened: 7/10/2024



Q-24-785

Aggregate / Emulsion Materials for Washington County Departments

Speciality Emulsions, Inc.
York, PA
HARD COPY QUOTE

Item No. Product Unit Price Per Unit
1 #57- Stone (1/2” — 1-1/27) AASHTO 57 Ton No Bid
2 #67 — Stone (3/4” or smaller) AASHTO 67 Ton No Bid
3 #1 Rip Rap (9”7 —18”) RS Ton No Bid
4 #2 Rip Rap (127 —24”) R6 Ton No Bid
5 B-10 Stone B10 Ton No Bid
6 CCR 3/4” Clean Crusher Run 3/4” Ton No Bid
7 CCR 3-1/2” Clean Crusher Run 3-1/2” Ton No Bid
8 DCR/RC6 Dirty Crusher Run Ton No Bid
9 CR6M Clean Crusher Run Ton No Bid
10 Gabion Stone (4” —77) AASHTO 89 Ton No Bid
11 MD 1 - Stone (2”7 —4”) AASHTO 1 Ton No Bid
12 Dust AASHTO 10 Ton No Bid
13 MBD 2 Stone (1”7 —-3”) AASHTO 2 Ton No Bid
14 MD 4 Stone (1/4” —3/4”) AASHTO 7 Ton No Bid
15 25.0 mm Base Mix — Course Ton No Bid
16 19.0 mm Base Mix — Fine Ton No Bid
17 Cold Mix Year-Round Application Use Ton No Bid

18A  |CRS2 Emulsion Gal $2.25
18B CSS-1H Tack Oil (5 Gallon Pail) Pail No Bid
19 SS - 1H Tack Oil (5 Gallon Pail) Pail No Bid
20 CSS-1H Tack Oil Gal No Bid
21 DW 9.5 mm Driveway Mix Ton No Bid
22 PF - 14.75 mm Surface Fine (Dust) Ton No Bid
23 4.75 mm Sand Mix / Surface Top Ton No Bid
24 SC 12.5 mm Surface Mix Course Ton No Bid
25 9.5 mm Surface Mix Fine Ton No Bid

Quotes Opened: 7/10/2024



Q-24-785

Aggregate / Emulsion Materials for Washington County Departments

Speciality Emulsions, Inc.

York, PA

Item No. Product Unit Price Per Unit

Licking Creek (Western Section) Ton/

26A Anti-Skid 9659 National Pike Delivered No Bid
Big Pool, MD 21711
Scenic Route #40

- QL (Salt Dome West of Hancock) Ton/ .

268 | Anti-Skid Route 144 Delivered No Bid
Hancock, MD 21750
Northern Avenue (Central Section) Ton/

26C Anti-Skid 601 Northern Avenue Delivered No Bid
Hagerstown, MD 21742
Keedysville (Southern Section) Ton/

26D Anti-Skid 6223 Coffman Farm Road Delivered No Bid
Keedysville, MD 21756
Greensburg (Eastern Section) Ton/

26E Anti-Skid 13230 Greensburg Road Delivered No Bid
Smithsburg, MD 21783
Solid Waste (Forty West Landfill) Ton/

26F Anti-Skid 12630 Earth Care Road . No Bid

Delivered

Hagerstown, MD 21740

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

Remarks/Exceptions:

Specialty Emulsions Inc. - Delivery / Service can be performed no later than 7 calendar days from receipt of order.

Haul / Delivery rate schedule attached

Quotes Opened: 7/10/2024



& 9401 SHARPSBURG PIKE
? C. WILLIAM HETZER. INC. HAGERSTOWN, MARYLAND 21740
GENERAL CONTRACTORS TELEPHONE: (301) 733-7300

FACSIMILE: (301) 733-0812
E-MAIL: estimating@cwilliamhetzer.com

HAUL/DELIVERY RATE SCHEDULE

AGGREGATE / EMULSION MATERIALS
FOR WASHINGTON COUNTY DEPARTMENTS

Q-24-785
BID DUE: 7/10/24 @ 3:30 PM

July 2024 MdSHA Asphalt Index - $620.00

Hauling Rate - $95.00 per hour

AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER



Please find below the delivery rates (mileage radius increments) for various Washington County
projects. Also enclosed is the Martin Marietta fuel surcharge policy that will apply to all delivered
material.

0 to 2 miles - $4.00
2 to 4 miles - $4.35
4 to 6 miles - $4.70
6 to 8 miles - $5.05
10 to 12 miles - $5.75
12 to 14 miles — $6.10
14 to 16 miles - $6.45
16 to 18 miles - $6.80

18 to 20 miles - §7.15

Timothy B. Bostic

Sales Representative

Martin Marietta

14932 Bottom Road, Williamsport, MD 21795

t.(240) 366-75681 m. (804) 363-1084 f. (301) 582-2662

e. tim.bostic@martinmarietia.com

www, martinmarietta.com

For easy, any time, secure access to your scale tickets/invoices/account info:

https://erocks.martinmarietta.com/erocks/login.page




¢
) Martin Brian Dulaney
Mor[@tta Capital District Sales Manager

Updated Fuel Surcharge Policy

5/26/2022

Effective May 31%, Martin Marietta will move to updating the Fuel Surcharge on a weekly basis. We will
continue to follow the previously communicated policy below.

Martin Marietta East Division Fuel Surcharge Policy

e All haut rates will be quoted using a base diesel fuel price of $3.75 per gallon

¢ Retail diesel fuel pricing will be monitored using the following website:

http://www.eia.gov/petroleum/gasdiesel/

» For every 50.10 increase in the diesel fuel price above $3.75/gallon, a 1% fuel surcharge will
apply to the freight portion of MM invoices.

e Example: Diesel price moves from $3.75/gal to $4.75/gal. Fuel surcharge will be 10 x 1% =
10% over the original quoted rate per ton

¢ The surcharge will be adjusted Monday night of each week, based on the Fuel Price
published that day on the EiA index. For example, we would pull the price on Monday, May
30™, and it is applied it to orders invoiced after the update. {Federal Holidays may impact
weekly timing)

Martin Marietta is committed to continue to provide the best customer experience possible and to remain
the preferred source for your construction materials needs.

If you have any questions regarding our policy, please contact your sales representative, or call me at
{443)462-0511.

Brian Dulaney
Capital District Sales Manager

Capital District

8140 Corporate Dr Suite 217, Nottingham, MD 21236

t. (410) 780-5788 m. (443} 462-0511 e. Brian.Dulaney@martinmarietta.com
www.martinmarietta.com




Com an
pany

3656-0330-0331 1-800-536-0332

Fax: (410) 355-5864

£ A 5

3601 FAIRFIELD ROAD

BALTIMORE, MARYLAND 21226

LINE ITEM NO. 17: $10.00 per ton

LINEITEM NO. 19: $176.00 per pallet (pallet contains up to 36 pails)



6/17124, 8:42 AM Asphalt Index | The Maryland Asphalt Association, Inc.

Prevailing Monthly Price for Asphalt

A chart showing the price is available when visiting our site on a desktop computer

Prevailing Monthly Price for Asphalt for June
2024 is: $620.00

Below are two SHA-approved spreadsheets that will allow you to monitor and report to your
District your AC, density, mix, and fuel adjustments. They will be updated monthly along with the
index for convenience. Click on them to download to your device.

£ Jun-2024-AC-Den-Mix-Form-00C100
% May-2024-Fuel-Adjustment-Form-00C101

Historical Pricing for Asphalt

Click a Year to Display a Table of the Pricing for That Year

2024

We use cookies on our websile to enhance your user experience and to analyze site usage
so we can further improve our website and marketing. By clicking "Accept” vou agree io
our use of cookies. To learn more about how we use cookies, view our Privacy Policy.

ACCEPT

https:/fmdasphalt.org/asphait-index/ 1/5




PECIALTY

LINE ITEM 18a: $0.10 per gallon

Specialty Emulsions, Inc.
1194 Zinns Quarry Road -York, PA 17404
Toll Free: (877) 849-5020 - Phone: (717) 849-5020 « Fax: (717)849-5014



617124, 8:43 AM Asphalt Index | The Maryland Asphalt Association, Inc.

Prevailing Monthly Price for Asphalt

A chart showing the price is available when visiting our site on a deskiop computer

Prevailing Monthly Price for Asphalt for June
2024 is: $620.00

Below are two SHA-approved spreadsheets that will allow you to monitor and report to your
District your AC, density, mix, and fuel adjustments. They will be updated monthly along with the
index for convenience. Click on them to download to your device.

% Jun-2024-AC-Den-Mix-Form-00C100
¢ May-2024-Fuel-Adjustment-Form-00C101

Historical Pricing for Asphalt

Click a Year to Display a Table of the Pricing for That Year

2024

We use cookies on our website 1o enhance your user experience and {0 analyze site usage
so we can further improve our website and marketing. By clicking "Accept” you agree 1o
our use of cookies. To learn more about how we use cookies, view our Privacy Policy.

ACCEPT

https://mdasphait.orgfasphalt-index/ 1/5
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