Q-21-696

AGGREGATE / EMULSION MATERIALS
for Washington County Departments

Item Product Unit C. William Hetzer, Inc. | Craig Paving, Inc. N!af‘tin Marietta P&W Excavating, Inc.
No. Hagerstown, MD Hagerstown, MD Williamsport, MD McConnellsburg, PA
1 |#57 Stone (%" - 114") AASHTO 57 Ton No Bid No Bid $13.00 No Bid
2 |#67 — Stone (3/4” or smaller) |AASHTO 67 Ton No Bid No Bid $13.15 No Bid
3 [#1 RipRap (97 -18”) RS Ton No Bid No Bid $22.25 No Bid
4 |#2Rip Rap (127 - 24”) R6 Ton No Bid No Bid $22.25 No Bid
5 |B-10 Stone B10 Ton No Bid No Bid $13.70 No Bid
6 [CCR%" Clean Crusher Run %" Ton No Bid No Bid $9.20 No Bid
7 |CCR 3-1/2" Clean Crusher Run 3-1/2” Ton No Bid No Bid $9.10 No Bid
8 |DCR/RC6 Dirty Crusher Run Ton No Bid No Bid $6.05 No Bid
9 [|CR6M Clean Crusher Run Ton No Bid No Bid $8.75 No Bid
10 [Gabion Stone (4" - 7") AASHTO 89 Ton No Bid No Bid $17.90 No Bid
11 |MD 1 Stone (2" - 4") AASHTO 1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 |Dust AASHTO 10 Ton No Bid No Bid $13.05 No Bid
13 |MD 2 Stone (1" -3") AASHTO 2 Ton No Bid No Bid $12.85 No Bid
14 |MD 4 Stone (4" - %") AASHTO 7 Ton No Bid No Bid $13.55 No Bid
15 |25.0mm Base Mix - Course Ton $45.50 $46.40 No Bid $58.00
16 |19.0mm Base Mix - Fine Ton $47.25 $50.30 No Bid $59.15
17 |Cold Mix Year Round Application Use Ton $100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18a |CRS2 Emulsion Gal No Bid $5.00 No Bid No Bid
18b |CSS-1H Tack Oil (5 Gallon Pail) Pail $35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 Quotes Opened: 7-10-2020



Q-21-696

AGGREGATE / EMULSION MATERIALS
for Washington County Departments

Item Product Unit C. William Hetzer, Inc. | Craig Paving, Inc. Martin Marietta P&W Excavating, Inc.
No. ! Hagerstown, MD Hagerstown, MD Williamsport, MD McConnellsburg, PA
19 |SS-1H Tack Oil (5 Gallon Pail) Pail No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 [CSS-1H Tack Oil Gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 [DW 9.5mm Driveway Mix Ton $60.00 $54.80 No Bid $67.25
22 |PF-14.75mm Surface Fine (Dust) Ton No Bid $66.60 No Bid No Bid
23 |4.75mm Sand Mix/Surface Top Ton No Bid $66.60 No Bid No Bid
24 |SC 12.5 mm Surface Mix Course Ton $55.00 $52.70 No Bid $64.30
25 19.5mm Surface Mix Fine Ton $57.00 No Bid No Bid $67.25
Anti-Skid — Licking Creek (Western Section) Ton/
26A 9659 National Pike Delarad No Bid No Bid $18.20 No Bid
Big Pool, MD 21711 ervere
Anti-Skid — Scenic Route #40
(Salt Dome West of Hancock) Ton/ . . .
26B Route 144 Delivered No Bid No Bid $18.20 No Bid
Hancock, MD 21750
Anti-Skid — Northern Avenue (Central Section) Ton/
26C 601 Northern Avenue Delharad No Bid No Bid $18.20 No Bid
Hagerstown, MD 21742 eltvere
Anti-Skid - Keedysville (Southern Section) Ton/
26D 6223 Coffiman Farm Road b l_"n ; No Bid No Bid $19.00 No Bid
Keedysville, MD 21756 eltvere
Anti-Skid - Greensburg (Eastern Section) Ton/
26E 13230 Greensburg Road D l.o J No Bid No Bid $19.00 No Bid
Smithsburg, MD 21783 elvere
Anti-Skid - Solid Waste - (Forty West Land(fill) Ton/
26F 12630 Earth Care Road D 1,0 J No Bid No Bid $18.20 No Bid
Hagerstown, MD 21740 elvere

*Quoter shall attach a haul/delivery rate schedule for items 1-25 attached.

Quotes Opened: 7-10-2020




Q-21-696

AGGREGATE / EMULSION MATERIALS
for Washington County Departments

Item . Russe.ll Standard . Seaboard Asphalt Specialty Emulsions, Inc.
No. Product Unit Corporation Fayetteville, Produ.cts Company York, PA
PA Baltimore, MD

1 |#57 Stone (%" - 14") AASHTO 57 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 |#67 — Stone (3/4” or smaller) AASHTO 67 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 |#1 RipRap (9”-18") R5 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 [#2 Rip Rap (12”7 -24") R6 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 |B-10 Stone B10 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 |CCR%" Clean Crusher Run %" Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 |CCR 3-1/2” Clean Crusher Run 3-1/2” Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 |DCR/RC6 Dirty Crusher Run Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 |CR6M Clean Crusher Run Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 [Gabion Stone (4" - 7") AASHTO 89 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 [MD 1 Stone (2" -4") AASHTO 1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 |Dust AASHTO 10 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 |MD 2 Stone (1" -3") AASHTO 2 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 |MD 4 Stone (V4" - %") AASHTO 7 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 |25.0mm Base Mix - Course Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 |19.0mm Base Mix - Fine Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
17 |Cold Mix Year Round Application Use Ton No Bid $96.00 No Bid
18a [CRS2 Emulsion Gal $2.65 No Bid $1.85
18b |CSS-1H Tack Oil (5 Gallon Pail) Pail No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Quotes Opened: 7-10-2020



Q-21-696

AGGREGATE / EMULSION MATERIALS
for Washington County Departments

Russell Standard Seaboard Asphalt . .
Item . . . Specialty Emulsions, Inc.
Product Unit Corporation Fayetteville,| Products Company
No. . York, PA
PA Baltimore, MD
19 |SS-1H Tack Oil (5 Gallon Pail) Pail No Bid $24.75 No Bid
20 |CSS-1H Tack Oil Gal $2.52 * No Bid $1.65 *
21 |DW 9.5mm Driveway Mix Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
22 |PF-14.75mm Surface Fine (Dust) Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 |4.75mm Sand Mix/Surface Top Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 |SC 12.5 mm Surface Mix Course Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 19.5mm Surface Mix Fine Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
Anti-Skid — Licking Creek (Western Section) Ton/
26A 9659 National Pike Delarod No Bid No Bid No Bid
Big Pool, MD 21711 elvere
Anti-Skid — Scenic Route #40
(Salt Dome West of Hancock) Ton/ . . .
26B Route 144 Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hancock, MD 21750
Anti-Skid — Northern Avenue (Central Section) Ton/
26C 601 Northern Avenue Delarad No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hagerstown, MD 21742 eltvere
Anti-Skid - Keedysville (Southern Section) Ton/
26D 6223 Coffinan Farm Road b 1,"“ ; No Bid No Bid No Bid
Keedysville, MD 21756 eltvere
Anti-Skid - Greensburg (Eastern Section) Ton/
26E 13230 Greensburg Road D 1,0 J No Bid No Bid No Bid
Smithsburg, MD 21783 eltvere
Anti-Skid - Solid Waste - (Forty West Land(fill) Ton/
26F 12630 Earth Care Road Delorad No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hagerstown, MD 21740 eltvere

*Quoter shall attach a haul/delivery rate schedule for items 1-25 attached.

Quotes Opened: 7-10-2020



Q-21-696
AGGREGATE / EMULSION MATERIALS
for Washington County Departments

*Notes:

Martin Marietta

#26A Pinesburg
#26B Warfordsburg
#26C Pinesburg
#26D Pinesburg
#26E Pinesburg
#26F Pinesburg

Russell Standard Corporation
#20 CRS-1H

Specialty Emulsions, Inc.
#20 Alt.. CRS-1H (MDSHA
Approved alternative)

Haul/Delivery Schedules:

C. William Hetzer, Inc.

June 2021 MdSHA Asphalt Index -
$510.00.

Hauling Rate - $80.00 per hour

Craig Paving, Inc.

Martin Marietta
Milage radius Increments
0 to 2 miles - $3.10

2 to 4 miles - $3.45

4 to 6 miles - $3.80

6 to 8 miles - $4.15

8 to 10 miles - $4.50
10 to 12 miles - $4.85
12 to 14 miles - $5.20
14 to 16 miles - $5.55
16 to 18 miles - $5.90
18 to 20 miles - $6.25

P & W Excavating, Inc.
Tri-Axle Dump Truck to deliver to WC
facilities $80 per hour portal to portal

Russell Standard Corporation

Seabord Asphalt Products Company
Line Item #17: $4 per ton delivered.
Minimum delivery quanity is 16 tons.
Line Item #19: No delivery charge for
pallet orders. Pallet contains 36 pails.

Speciality Emulsions, Inc.
Line Item #18a: $0.20 per gallon delivery
rate. Minimum delivery quanity is 2500
gallons.

Line Item #20: $0.20 per gallon delivery
rate. Minimum delivery quantity is 2500
gallons.
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