
1 Liquid Chlorine
  Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes

UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 CYLINDER $2,550.00 $2,550.00
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 CYLINDER No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 CYLINDER No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 CYLINDER No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 CYLINDER No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 CYLINDER No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid

2 Aqueous Ammonia 19%
   Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes

UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 POUND $0.14 $0.14 Price in wet lbs. Minimum 45,000 lbs. Deliveries 
are typically made during weekdays with two (2)
hours of unloading time. Weekend and holiday 
deliveries are available for an additional charge. 
Additional unloading time will be billed at an 
additional $150 per hour.

Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 POUND $0.20 $0.20 Minimum 45,000lbs delivery. Includes 
2hrs of unloading

Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 POUND No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 POUND No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 POUND No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 POUND No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 POUND No Bid

PUR-1708
SWIMMING POOL & WATER/WASTEWATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 POUND No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 POUND No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 POUND No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 POUND $0.22 $0.22 *40,000 lb minimum order
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid

3 Ferric Chloride
   Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 DRY TON $1,156.48 $1,156.48
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 DRY TON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 DRY TON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 DRY TON No Bid
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 DRY TON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 DRY TON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 DRY TON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 DRY TON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 DRY TON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 DRY TON No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 DRY TON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 DRY TON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 DRY TON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 DRY TON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 DRY TON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 DRY TON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 DRY TON $1,223.00 $1,223.00 Recommended delivery window is 3-7 

business days ARO
4 Polymer

   Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON $13.68 $13.68 Emulsion grade polymers are normally sold by the 

liquid pound.  As such, we are submitting our per 
pound price as well as the price per gallon.  
Pollu-Treat CL-186 at $1.60 / lb delivered in tote 
(2300 lbs.) quantities.

UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON $13.86 $13.86 Totes are 275 gal or 2300 lbs.
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

5 12.5% Sodium Hypochlorite
   Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes

UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON $7.00 $7.00 $7.00 PER GALLON
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

6 Powdered Activated Carbon
   Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes

George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 TON $2,966.43 $2,966.43
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 TON $3,430.00 $3,430.00 7-10 Days ARO
USALCO, LLC 1 TON No Bid

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 TON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 TON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 TON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 TON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 TON No Bid
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 TON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 TON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 TON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 TON $5,900.00 $5,900.00 *8,000 lb min. order
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 TON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 TON No Bid

7 Polyaluminum Chloride (PAC)
  Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes

USALCO, LLC 1 WET TON $618.00 $618.00
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 WET TON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 WET TON No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 WET TON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 WET TON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 WET TON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 WET TON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 WET TON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 WET TON No Bid
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 WET TON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 WET TON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 WET TON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 WET TON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 WET TON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 WET TON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 WET TON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 WET TON No Bid

8
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON $1.06 $1.06
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid

Caustic Soda (Sodium Hydroxide 25%)

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON $1.1699 $1.1699 *4,500 gallon minimum order
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

9
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON $3.09 $3.09 Minimum 2,000 Gallons Sulfuric acid Bulk
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON $3.09 $3.09
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON $2.95 $2.95 *3,000 gallon minimum order
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

10 Sulfuric Acid 93% - 95%
  Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes

Sulfuric Acid 93% - 95%

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON $6.97 $6.97 Minimum order 2 drums
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON $14.40 $14.40
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON $8.75 $8.75 *2 drum minimum order
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

11 Sodium Hypochlorite
   Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes

UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON $5.08 $5.08 Minimum order 4 drums - Minimum order 4
drums you can mix/match various materials to
meet 4 drum MOQ

George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON $5.11 $5.11
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON $7.00 $385.00 1 Drum $385.00
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON $5.07 $5.07 *4 drum minimum order
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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12 Potassium Permanganate
       Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes

CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 POUND $2.49 $2.49 3-7 days ARO
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 POUND $4.89 $4.89 Carus domestic material
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 POUND No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 POUND No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 POUND No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 POUND No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 POUND No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 POUND No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 POUND $5.60 $5.60 *250 lb minimum order
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid

13
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON $3.10 $3.10 25% Caustic soda.  Minimum order 4 drums - 

you can mix/match various materials to meet 
4 drum MOQ

George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON $5.55 $5.55
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON $3.4450 $3.4450 *4 drum minimum order

Caustic Soda (Sodium Hydroxide)

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

14
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON $5.63 $5.63 Addendum #3 changed this to price per minibulk 

and removed the 15 gal drums.  Our price stated 
here @ $5.6299 is for minibulk stated on the
price page, not the 15 gal drums stated here.

Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

15
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON $5.45 $5.45 Minimum order 4 drums - you can mix/match 

various materials to meet 4 drum MOQ
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON $6.76 $6.76
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid

Hydrofluosilicic Acid (H2SiF6) 30%

Hydrofluosilicic Acid (H2SiF6) 30%

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

16
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON $5.45 $5.45 Minimum order 4 drums - you can mix/match 

various materials to meet 4 drum MOQ
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON $8.05 $8.05
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

17
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
USALCO, LLC 1 POUND $0.24 $0.24
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 POUND $0.26 $0.26
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 POUND No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 POUND No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 POUND No Bid
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 POUND No Bid

DelPac 2000 (Polyaluminum Chloride Hydroxide Sulfate Solution) or PAX-XL6

Hydrofluosilicic Acid (H2SiF6) 30%

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 POUND No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 POUND No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 POUND No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid

18
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 POUND $2.94 $2.94
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 POUND $3.06 $3.06 24 pail minimum order requirement.

Westlake 60 lb. pail ACCU-TAB
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 POUND No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 POUND No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 POUND No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 POUND No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 POUND No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 POUND No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 POUND No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid

19
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON $5.08 $5.08 Minimum order 4 drums - you can mix/match 

various materials to meet 4 drum MOQ
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid

Sodium Hypochlorite

3” Tablet Chlorine (Calcium Hypochlorite)

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON $7.00 $385.00 One Drum $385.00
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

20
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 POUND No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 POUND No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 POUND No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 POUND No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 POUND No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 POUND No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 POUND No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid

21
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 POUND No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 POUND No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 POUND No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 POUND No Bid

Cyanuric Acid

Calcium Chloride

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 POUND No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 POUND No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 POUND No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid

22 Muriatic Acid
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON $35.63 $35.63
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

23
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 POUND $0.43 $0.43 SBS 38%-42%  225 gallon Non Returnable TOTE
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 POUND $0.47 $0.47
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 POUND $0.47 $0.47
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 POUND No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 POUND No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 POUND No Bid

Sodium Bisulfite 38 - 40%

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 POUND No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 POUND No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 POUND No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid

24
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON $4.70 $4.70 Minimum order 4 drums - you can mix/match 

various materials to meet 4 drum MOQ
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON $5.42 $5.42
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

25
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON $35.63 $35.63
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid

DelPAC 2020 (Polyaluminum Hydroxychlorosulfate Solution)

Hydrochloric Acid

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024



PUR-1708
SWIMMING POOL & WATER/WASTEWATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

26
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON $8.02 $8.02 Remark: Trucking companies have been adding a

fuel surcharge as a separate line item on their bills 
ranging from 245.00. to 275.00 per 8 drum
shipments. We would appreciate it if Hagerstown
WWTP would pay 1/2 of that surcharge as we
pay the fright plus the other half of the surcharge.
The decision to pay the 50% of the surcharge is
totally up to Hagerstown WWTP and does not
affect our Anti-Foam bid price.
 Thank you, C. Richard Marcheski, President

North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON $11.45 $11.45
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON $11.58 $11.58 Free 5-gal pails for plant trial
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

Defoamer – Anti-Foam

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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27
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON $3.49 $3.49
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

28
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON -$0.26 -$0.26 "Current month MNDRP Index LESS $0.026 /

gallon” Minimum order quantity 7,000 Gallons.
SEPTEMBER  2024 MNDRP $2.17/Gal - 
$.26/Gal  = $1.91/Gal   September 1, 2024 – 
September 30, 2024) Methanex Non-Discounted 
Reference Price USD 2.17/Gal*

Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid

Thioguard (55-65% Magnesium Hydroxide) 

Methanol

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON $0.13 $0.13 *7,000 gallon minimum order
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON $0.09 $0.09 $0.09/gallon over Methanex index for Sept. 2024

Methanex posted Sep. 2024 at $2.17/gal
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

29
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 POUND $8.73 $8.73 Packaged in 25 lb. pails.
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 POUND $8.95 $8.95
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 POUND $9.00 $9.00 Remark: Our MB 15 BP product meets the 

specifications.  Packaged in 1/2 pound water 
soluble bags, 50 per 25-pound buckets which is the
industry standard packaging.  Whereas the bacteria
are in dormant stage until introduced to the need,
we make ourselves available by phone or on site to
provide technical assistance regarding dosages,
application and results at no additional charge.or
on site to provide technical assistance to address
treatment problems, dosages, results etc. at no
additional charge to the client.

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 POUND No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 POUND No Bid
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 POUND No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 POUND No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 POUND No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 POUND No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid

30
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 POUND $0.89 $0.89 LOP-1200   5-10 Days ARO for Bulk orders

Bacterial Enzymatic Powder

Poly-Orthophosphate Solution (SLI-5250)

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 POUND $1.57 $1.57
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 POUND No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 POUND No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 POUND No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 POUND No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 POUND No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 POUND No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid

31
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

32
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON No Bid

50% Caustic Soda (Sodium Hydroxide) 

25% Caustic Soda (Sodium Hydroxide) 

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

33
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON $5.72 $5.72 Minimum order 4 drums - you can mix/match

various materials to meet 4 drum MOQ
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

34
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes

DelPac 2000 (Aluminum Chloride Hydroxide Sulfate)

Liquid Aluminum Sulfate

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON $2.21 $2.21 Minimum 2,000 gallons 7-10 Business days delivery
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

35
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON $4.68 $4.68
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON $6.33 $6.33 265 Gallon Non returnable Tote.
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

36
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes

Micro C 2000

Polymer (Zetag 8814)

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 GALLON $19.06 $19.06
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 GALLON No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 GALLON No Bid
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 GALLON No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 GALLON No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 GALLON No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 GALLON No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 GALLON No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 GALLON No Bid

37
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 POUND $0.44 $0.44 2 pallets weigh 4,900lbs.
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 POUND $0.48 $0.48 Minimum order 98 bags
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 POUND No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 POUND No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 POUND No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 POUND No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 POUND No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 POUND No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 POUND No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid

38
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes

Morton Salt

Magnetite 

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 POUND $0.69 $0.69 30000 lbs minimum order   7 days ARO
USALCO, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 POUND No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 POUND No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 POUND No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 POUND No Bid
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 POUND No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 POUND No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid

39
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 CYLINDER $455.00 $455.00 Minimum order 8 cylinders
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 CYLINDER $600.00 $600.00
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 CYLINDER No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 CYLINDER No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 CYLINDER No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 CYLINDER No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid

40
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes

Chlorine Gas

Sulfur Dioxide Gas

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 CYLINDER $195.00 $195.00 Minimum order quantity  8 cylinders Tech grade 
material.

JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 CYLINDER $350.00 $350.00
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 CYLINDER No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 CYLINDER No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 CYLINDER No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 CYLINDER No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 CYLINDER No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 CYLINDER No Bid

41
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 BAG $42.00 $42.00
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 BAG No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 BAG No Bid
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 BAG No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 BAG No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 BAG No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 BAG No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 BAG No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 BAG No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 BAG No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 BAG No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 BAG No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 BAG No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 BAG No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 BAG No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 BAG No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 BAG No Bid

42

Diatomaceous Earth

Carbon Dioxide

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS USA LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 1 POUND No Bid
CHEMRITE, INC. (CHEMRITE, INCORPORATED) 1 POUND No Bid
USALCO, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc 1 POUND No Bid
Premier Magnesia, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Biochemical Company 1 POUND No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1 POUND No Bid
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) 1 POUND No Bid
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor 1 POUND No Bid
Atlantic Coast Ploymers, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Brenntag Northeast, LLC 1 POUND No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
PVS Technologies, Inc. 1 POUND No Bid
Remarks/Exceptions:
Amato Industries, Inc./Amchlor - $50.00 Delivery Fee (combined Web form with Hard copy form)
Atlantic Coast Polymers, Inc. - Non Responsive, did not use Revised Form of Proposal
Brenntag Northeast, LLC - Non Responsive, did not use Revised Form of Proposal

Amato Industries, Inc./ Amchlor - Silver Spring, MD Pollu-Tech, Inc. (Pollu-Tech Inc.) - DuBois, PA
Atlantic Coast Polymers, Inc. - Lauderdale-By-The-Sea, FL Premier Magnesia, LLC - Waynesville, DE
Brenntag Northeast LLC - Reading, PA PVS Technologies, Inc. - Detroit, MI
Chemrite, Inc. (Chemrite Incorporated) - Buford, GA Shannon Chemical Corporation - Malvern, PA
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. - Savannah, GA Univar Solutions USA LLC - Morrisville, PA
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc. -Croydon,PA USALCO, LLC - Baltimore, MD
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc - Sarasota, FL
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc - Atlanta, GA
Maryland Biochemical Company - Bel Air, MD
Maryland Chemical Company, Inc. - Baltimore, MD
North Industrial Chemicals, Inc. - York, PA

Bids Due:  October 22, 2024
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