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Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
James River Solutions, LLC 1 BID FACTOR 0.2720 0.2720 $2.29 OPIS + BID FACTOR
Sunoco, LLC 1 BID FACTOR 0.7500 0.7500
Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc. 1 BID FACTOR 0.8556 0.8556
Indigo Energy Corporation 1 BID FACTOR No Bid No Bid
Petroleum Traders Corporation 1 BID FACTOR No Bid No Bid
Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville 1 BID FACTOR No Bid No Bid
A.C.&T. Co, Inc. 1 BID FACTOR 0.2840 0.2840

2
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
James River Solutions, LLC 1 BID FACTOR 0.2720 0.2720 $2.4777 OPIS + BID FACTOR
Sunoco, LLC 1 BID FACTOR 0.7500 0.7500
Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc. 1 BID FACTOR 0.8556 0.8556
Indigo Energy Corporation 1 BID FACTOR No Bid No Bid
Petroleum Traders Corporation 1 BID FACTOR No Bid No Bid
Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville 1 BID FACTOR No Bid No Bid
A.C.&T. Co, Inc. 1 BID FACTOR 0.2840 0.2840 Item No. 2 Note: Tankwagon Storage tank for 

89 Octane gas is out of service indefinitely. 
Hagerstown Community College was notified and 

3
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
Petroleum Traders Corporation 1 BID FACTOR -0.0256 -0.0256
Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville 1 BID FACTOR 0.0081 0.0081
James River Solutions, LLC 1 BID FACTOR 0.0174 0.0174 $2.0354 OPIS + BID FACTOR
Sunoco, LLC 1 BID FACTOR 0.0549 0.0549
Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc. 1 BID FACTOR 0.0871 0.0871
Indigo Energy Corporation 1 BID FACTOR 2.0317 2.0317
A.C.&T. Co, Inc. 1 BID FACTOR 0.0850 0.0850

4
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
Petroleum Traders Corporation 1 BID FACTOR -0.0555 -0.0555
James River Solutions, LLC 1 BID FACTOR -0.0016 -0.0016 $2.2041 OPIS + BID FACTOR
Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville 1 BID FACTOR 0.0190 0.0190
Sunoco, LLC 1 BID FACTOR 0.0549 0.0549
Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc. 1 BID FACTOR 0.0871 0.0871
Indigo Energy Corporation 1 BID FACTOR 2.1997 2.1997
A.C.&T. Co, Inc. 1 BID FACTOR 0.0850 0.0850

PUR-1707
Bulk Gasoline & Diesel Fuel Delivery

Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane CBOB Ethanol (10%) Tank-wagon

Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane CBOB Ethanol (10%) Tank-wagon

Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane CBOB Ethanol (10%) Transport

Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane CBOB Ethanol (10%) Transport

Bids Due:  October 21, 2024



PUR-1707
Bulk Gasoline & Diesel Fuel Delivery

5
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
James River Solutions, LLC 1 BID FACTOR 0.2670 0.2670 $2.379 OPIS + BID FACTOR
Sunoco, LLC 1 BID FACTOR 0.7500 0.7500
Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc. 1 BID FACTOR 0.8556 0.8556
Indigo Energy Corporation 1 BID FACTOR No Bid No Bid
Petroleum Traders Corporation 1 BID FACTOR No Bid No Bid
Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville 1 BID FACTOR No Bid No Bid
A.C.&T. Co, Inc. 1 BID FACTOR 0.2740 0.2740

6
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
Petroleum Traders Corporation 1 BID FACTOR 0.0425 0.0425
Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville 1 BID FACTOR 0.0534 0.0534
Sunoco, LLC 1 BID FACTOR 0.0549 0.0549
James River Solutions, LLC 1 BID FACTOR 0.0635 0.0635 $2.1755 OPIS + BID FACTOR
Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc. 1 BID FACTOR 0.8556 0.8556
Indigo Energy Corporation 1 BID FACTOR 2.1527 2.1527
A.C.&T. Co, Inc. 1 BID FACTOR 0.0900 0.0900

7
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes
Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville 1 PER GALLON 0.0300 0.0300 Winter Chemical Additive Protection Product Name:

ColdPROManufacturers Name: Arsenal ColdPRO
Sunoco, LLC 1 PER GALLON 0.0300 0.0300
Indigo Energy Corporation 1 PER GALLON 0.0327 0.0327 Cold FlowPrimrose winter blend.
James River Solutions, LLC 1 PER GALLON 0.0350 0.0350
Petroleum Traders Corporation 1 PER GALLON 0.0500 0.0500 Product Name: Diesel Treat 2000 Ultra Low Sulfur

Winter Premium  (#137ULSW)Manufacturer:
Schaeffer Manufacturing Company

Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc. 1 PER GALLON 0.0500 0.0500 Diesel Treat 2000, Ultra Low Sulfur Premium
(Schaeffer Manufacturing Company)

A.C.&T. Co, Inc. 1 BID FACTOR No Bid No Bid Tankwagon $.03/gal   //   Transport $.05/gal
CFI 1902   //  137 ULSW Diesel Treat 2000
Innospec  //  Schaeffer Manufacturing

PUR-1707 Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries
Awarded as Follows:

Transport Loads of Gasoline & Diesel Fuel awaded to Petroleum Traders Corporation
Tank-Wagon Loads of Gasoline & Diesel Fuel awarded to James River Solutions, LLC

Winter Chemical Additive Protection (cost per gallon)

No. 2-D Diesel Ultra Low Sulfur

No. 2-D Diesel Ultra Low Sulfur

Bids Due:  October 21, 2024
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