
Q-16-621
Examination Gloves

Quotes Opened: August 31, 2016

Item Description 
Approx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor
Item #

Unit
Price

Vendor
Item #

Vendor
Item #

Unit
Price

Vendor
Item #

1 Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large, 4 mil. or 
County approved equal. 20 RAD64057707 2.87 1015-11482 1190377 $1.90 500-3 

AMERCARE
$2.50 *

2 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil. 41 RAD64056426 $6.43 1015-91601 $5.33 * 5650495 $7.07 700-1 

AMERCARE $3.40 *

3 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil. 72 RAD64056427 $6.43 1015-91602 $5.33 * 5658308 $7.07 700-2 

AMERCARE $3.40 *

4 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil. 110 RAD64056427 $6.43 1015-91603 $5.33 * 5653972 $7.07 700-3 

AMERCARE $3.40 *

5 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil. 140 RAD64056429 $6.43 1015-91604 $5.33 * 5653009 $7.07 700-4 

AMERCARE $3.40 *

6 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
Textured Grip, 2X-Large, 5 mil. 100 MCRFFE-775-

XXL $8.50 1015-91605 $2.66 * 4993336 $5.01 700-5 
AMERCARE $3.40 *

7 UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex 
Ultra One #UL315, no substitutions 90 MCRUL-315-M $9.85 290316 $14.94 * 5653125 $13.01 BTM 290316

8 UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex 
Ultra One #UL315, no substitutions 30 MCRUL-315-L $9.85 290317 $14.94 * 5653153 $13.01 BTM 290318

$3.99 

Henry Schein, Inc.
Irmo, SC

Airgas USA, LLC
Allentown, PA

Items 1, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, & 19 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.
Items 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6 awarded to J & J Enterprises.

Items 7, 8, 9, 11, 12, & 13 awarded to Airgas USA, LLC.
Item 10 awarded to Mastermans LLP.

Bound Tree Medical, 
LLC

Dublin, OH

Unit
Price

J & J Enterprises
Summerville, SC

Unit
Price



Q-16-621
Examination Gloves

Quotes Opened: August 31, 2016

Item Description 
Approx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor
Item #

Unit
Price

Vendor
Item #

Vendor
Item #

Unit
Price

Vendor
Item #

 

Henry Schein, Inc.
Irmo, SC

Airgas USA, LLC
Allentown, PA

Items 1, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, & 19 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.
Items 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6 awarded to J & J Enterprises.

Items 7, 8, 9, 11, 12, & 13 awarded to Airgas USA, LLC.
Item 10 awarded to Mastermans LLP.

Bound Tree Medical, 
LLC

Dublin, OH

Unit
Price

J & J Enterprises
Summerville, SC

Unit
Price

9
UL315L, Exam glove, Extra Large, 
Microflex Ultra One #UL315, no 
substitutions

100 MCRUL-315-XL $9.85 290318 $14.94 * 5653154 $13.01

10 Exam glove, 2X-Large, Comparable to 
#UL315, 14 mil.12" length. 202 DISCONTINUED

Not Bidding on 
This Item No Bid

11

Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, 
Medium, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 
12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 
substitutions

4 S636602-20 $9.21 Not Bidding on 
This Item No Bid

12

Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, 
Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 
Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 
substitutions

89 S636603-20 $9.21 Not Bidding on 
This Item No Bid

13

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-
Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 
Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 
substitutions

608 S636604-20 $9.21 Not Bidding on 
This Item No Bid



Q-16-621
Examination Gloves

Quotes Opened: August 31, 2016

Item Description 
Approx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor
Item #

Unit
Price

Vendor
Item #

Vendor
Item #

Unit
Price

Vendor
Item #

 

Henry Schein, Inc.
Irmo, SC

Airgas USA, LLC
Allentown, PA

Items 1, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, & 19 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.
Items 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6 awarded to J & J Enterprises.

Items 7, 8, 9, 11, 12, & 13 awarded to Airgas USA, LLC.
Item 10 awarded to Mastermans LLP.

Bound Tree Medical, 
LLC

Dublin, OH

Unit
Price

J & J Enterprises
Summerville, SC

Unit
Price

14

Microflex Midknight MK296L, Black, 
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 
Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 
no substitutions

102 MCRMK-296-L $8.94 1015-29603 5651031 $6.51

15

Microflex Midknight MK296XL, Black, 
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 
X Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 
no substitutions

142 MCRMK-296-XL $8.94 1015-29604 5650811 $6.51

16

Apex Pro Powder-Free Nitrile Exam 
Gloves, AP12-1, White exterior, Black 
interior, 2-Ply Techology, Small, length 12 
inches, cuff 4.3 mil, palm 5.8 mil, finger 8.3 
mil, tensile strength 24 Mpa, no 
substitutions

10 NO BID 1015-11201 7001962 $11.09

17

Apex Pro Powder-Free Nitrile Exam 
Gloves, AP12-1, White exterior, Black 
interior, 2-Ply Techology, Medium, length 
12 inches, cuff 4.3 mil, palm 5.8 mil, finger 
8.3 mil, tensile strength 24 Mpa, no 
substitutions

10 NO BID 1015-11202 7001963 $11.09

$7.19

$11.49

$11.49

$7.19



Q-16-621
Examination Gloves

Quotes Opened: August 31, 2016

Item Description 
Approx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor
Item #

Unit
Price

Vendor
Item #

Vendor
Item #

Unit
Price

Vendor
Item #

 

Henry Schein, Inc.
Irmo, SC

Airgas USA, LLC
Allentown, PA

Items 1, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, & 19 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.
Items 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6 awarded to J & J Enterprises.

Items 7, 8, 9, 11, 12, & 13 awarded to Airgas USA, LLC.
Item 10 awarded to Mastermans LLP.

Bound Tree Medical, 
LLC

Dublin, OH

Unit
Price

J & J Enterprises
Summerville, SC

Unit
Price

18

Apex Pro Powder-Free Nitrile Exam 
Gloves, AP12-1, White exterior, Black 
interior, 2-Ply Techology, Large, length 12 
inches, cuff 4.3 mil, palm 5.8 mil, finger 8.3 
mil, tensile strength 24 Mpa, no 
substitutions

10 NO BID 1015-11203 7001964 $11.09

19

Apex Pro Powder-Free Nitrile Exam 
Gloves, AP12-1, White exterior, Black 
interior, 2-Ply Techology, X Large, length 
12 inches, cuff 4.3 mil, palm 5.8 mil, finger 
8.3 mil, tensile strength 24 Mpa, no 
substitutions

10 NO BID 1015-11204 7001965 $11.09

Notes:
BoundTree Medical, LLC

Item: Notes: Item: Notes:
2 *Sold Seven Dollars and Ninety Nine Cents Sold: 7.99/BX of 150 1 AMERCARE
3 *Sold Seven Dollars and Ninety Nine Cents Sold: 7.99/BX of 150 2 AMERCARE
4 *Sold Seven Dollars and Ninety Nine Cents Sold: 7.99/BX of 150 3 AMERCARE
5 *Sold Seven Dollars and Ninety Nine Cents Sold: 7.99/BX of 150 4 AMERCARE
6 *Sold Seven Dollars and Ninety Nine Cents Sold: 7.99/BX of 150 5 AMERCARE
7 *Sold Seven Dollars and Forty Seven Cents Sold: 7.47/BX of 50 6 90 Gloves/Box  AMERCARE
8 *Sold Seven Dollars and Forty Seven Cents Sold: 7.47/BX of 50
9 *Sold Seven Dollars and Forty Seven Cents Sold: 7.47/BX of 50

J & J Enterprises

$11.49

$11.49



Q-16-621
Examination Gloves

Quotes Opened: August 31, 2016

Item Description 
Approx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor
Item #

Unit
Price

Vendor
Item #

Vendor
Item #

Vendor
Item #

1 Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large, 4 mil. or 
County approved equal. 20 VN9708 $2.60 GVY-5220-LG NB NO BID

2 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil. 41 EN501 $4.70 GNI-GNEP-SM EMP5400S $3.78 * EGL-521811-5 $9.18 *

3 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil. 72 EN502 $4.70 GNI-GNEP-MD EMP5400M $3.78 * EGL-521812-5 $9.18 *

4 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil. 110 EN503 $4.70 GNI-GNEP-LG EMP5400L $3.78 * EGL-521813-5 $9.18 *

5 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil. 140 EN504 $4.70 GNI-GNEP-XL EMP5400XL $3.78 * EGL-521814-5 $9.18 *

6 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
Textured Grip, 2X-Large, 5 mil. 100 GNI-5017-2X $5.16 * NB EGL-528605-5 $6.25 *

7 UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex 
Ultra One #UL315, no substitutions 90 UL315M $15.50 GNR-UL315-MD MICUL-315-M $11.40 * EGL-527502 $12.40

8 UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex 
Ultra One #UL315, no substitutions 30 UL315L $15.50 GNR-UL315-LG MICUL-315-L $11.40 * EGL-527503 $12.40

Lamco Safety Products
Hanover, PA

Midwest Medial 
Supply Co, LLC
Earth City, MO

Mastermans LLP
Auburn, MA

Unit    
Price

$5.26

$5.26

$5.26

$5.26

$3.84

$11.28

$11.28

QuadMed
Jacksonville, FL

Unit
Price

Unit
Price

Items 1, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, & 19 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.
Items 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6 awarded to J & J Enterprises.

Items 7, 8, 9, 11, 12, & 13 awarded to Airgas USA, LLC.
Item 10 awarded to Mastermans LLP.



Q-16-621
Examination Gloves

Quotes Opened: August 31, 2016

Item Description 
Approx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor
Item #

Unit
Price

Vendor
Item #

Vendor
Item #

Vendor
Item #

Lamco Safety Products
Hanover, PA

Midwest Medial 
Supply Co, LLC
Earth City, MO

Mastermans LLP
Auburn, MA

Unit    
Price

QuadMed
Jacksonville, FL

Unit
Price

Unit
Price

Items 1, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, & 19 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.
Items 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6 awarded to J & J Enterprises.

Items 7, 8, 9, 11, 12, & 13 awarded to Airgas USA, LLC.
Item 10 awarded to Mastermans LLP.

9
UL315L, Exam glove, Extra Large, 
Microflex Ultra One #UL315, no 
substitutions

100 UL315XL $15.50 GNR-UL315-XL MICUL-315-XL $11.40 * EGL-527504 $12.40

10 Exam glove, 2X-Large, Comparable to 
#UL315, 14 mil.12" length. 202 GREL-2X-5M-P NB EGL-526404 $12.40 *

11

Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, 
Medium, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 
12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 
substitutions

4 6602-20 $9.29 NO BID NB NO BID

12

Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, 
Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 
Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 
substitutions

89 6603-20 $9.29 NO BID NB NO BID

13

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-
Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 
Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 
substitutions

608 6604-20 $9.29 NO BID NB NO BID

$9.69

$11.28



Q-16-621
Examination Gloves

Quotes Opened: August 31, 2016

Item Description 
Approx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor
Item #

Unit
Price

Vendor
Item #

Vendor
Item #

Vendor
Item #

Lamco Safety Products
Hanover, PA

Midwest Medial 
Supply Co, LLC
Earth City, MO

Mastermans LLP
Auburn, MA

Unit    
Price

QuadMed
Jacksonville, FL

Unit
Price

Unit
Price

Items 1, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, & 19 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.
Items 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6 awarded to J & J Enterprises.

Items 7, 8, 9, 11, 12, & 13 awarded to Airgas USA, LLC.
Item 10 awarded to Mastermans LLP.

14

Microflex Midknight MK296L, Black, 
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 
Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 
no substitutions

102 MK-296-XL $11.00 GNI-MK-296-LG MICMK-296-L EGL-520403-5

15

Microflex Midknight MK296XL, Black, 
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 
X Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 
no substitutions

142 MK-296-XL $11.00 GNI-MK-296-XL MICMK-296-L EGL-520404-5

16

Apex Pro Powder-Free Nitrile Exam 
Gloves, AP12-1, White exterior, Black 
interior, 2-Ply Techology, Small, length 12 
inches, cuff 4.3 mil, palm 5.8 mil, finger 8.3 
mil, tensile strength 24 Mpa, no 
substitutions

10 NO BID DIGAP12-1 EGL-528701-5

17

Apex Pro Powder-Free Nitrile Exam 
Gloves, AP12-1, White exterior, Black 
interior, 2-Ply Techology, Medium, length 
12 inches, cuff 4.3 mil, palm 5.8 mil, finger 
8.3 mil, tensile strength 24 Mpa, no 
substitutions

10 NO BID DIGAP12-2 EGL-528702-5

$10.06 $9.34

$9.34$10.06

$11.56

$11.56 $10.75

$10.75

$9.95

$9.95



Q-16-621
Examination Gloves

Quotes Opened: August 31, 2016

Item Description 
Approx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor
Item #

Unit
Price

Vendor
Item #

Vendor
Item #

Vendor
Item #

Lamco Safety Products
Hanover, PA

Midwest Medial 
Supply Co, LLC
Earth City, MO

Mastermans LLP
Auburn, MA

Unit    
Price

QuadMed
Jacksonville, FL

Unit
Price

Unit
Price

Items 1, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, & 19 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.
Items 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6 awarded to J & J Enterprises.

Items 7, 8, 9, 11, 12, & 13 awarded to Airgas USA, LLC.
Item 10 awarded to Mastermans LLP.

18

Apex Pro Powder-Free Nitrile Exam 
Gloves, AP12-1, White exterior, Black 
interior, 2-Ply Techology, Large, length 12 
inches, cuff 4.3 mil, palm 5.8 mil, finger 8.3 
mil, tensile strength 24 Mpa, no 
substitutions

10 NO BID DIGAP12-3 EGL-528703-5

19

Apex Pro Powder-Free Nitrile Exam 
Gloves, AP12-1, White exterior, Black 
interior, 2-Ply Techology, X Large, length 
12 inches, cuff 4.3 mil, palm 5.8 mil, finger 
8.3 mil, tensile strength 24 Mpa, no 
substitutions

10 NO BID DIGAP12-4 EGL-528704-5

Notes:
Mastermans LLP

Item: Notes: Item: Notes:
6 100/Bx 2 Microflex PN290 - 200/BX

3 Microflex PN290 - 200/BX
Midwest Medical Supply Co, LLC 4 Microflex PN290 - 200/BX

Item: Notes: 5 Microflex PN290 - 180/BX
2 Emphasis 6 Microflex Supreno EC - 50/BX
3 Emphasis 10 Microflex Synetron - XXL
4 Emphasis
5 Emphasis
7 Price per box containing 50 pieces
8 Price per box containing 50 pieces
9 Price per box containing 50 pieces

QuadMed

$11.56

$11.56

$10.75

$10.75



Q-16-621
Examination Gloves

Quotes Opened: August 31, 2016

Item Description 
Approx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor
Item #

Vendor
Item #

1
Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large, 4 mil. or 
County approved equal.

20 Safe-Handle
SHPFVINL 2304

2 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil. 41 SHPFBLUN4.5 S 068-6

3 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil. 72 SHPFBLUN4.5M 068-7

4 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil. 110 SHPFBLUN4.5 L 068-8

5 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil. 140 SHPFBLUN4.5X

L 068-9

6 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
Textured Grip, 2X-Large, 5 mil. 100 NB 094-0

7 UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex 
Ultra One #UL315, no substitutions 90 NB UL315M

8 UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex 
Ultra One #UL315, no substitutions 30 NB UL315L

$3.58

$3.58

$3.58

Unit
Price

SMS Ambassadors 
Corp

Toledo, OH

The Glove Box, Inc.
Charlotte, NC

Unit
Price

$3.67

$3.67

$3.67

Items 1, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, & 19 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.
Items 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6 awarded to J & J Enterprises.

Items 7, 8, 9, 11, 12, & 13 awarded to Airgas USA, LLC.
Item 10 awarded to Mastermans LLP.

$3.65

$1.89 $2.63

$3.67

$5.39

$13.03

$13.03



Q-16-621
Examination Gloves

Quotes Opened: August 31, 2016

Item Description 
Approx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor
Item #

Vendor
Item #

Unit
Price

SMS Ambassadors 
Corp

Toledo, OH

The Glove Box, Inc.
Charlotte, NC

Unit
Price

Items 1, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, & 19 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.
Items 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6 awarded to J & J Enterprises.

Items 7, 8, 9, 11, 12, & 13 awarded to Airgas USA, LLC.
Item 10 awarded to Mastermans LLP.

9
UL315L, Exam glove, Extra Large, 
Microflex Ultra One #UL315, no 
substitutions

100 NB UL315XL

10 Exam glove, 2X-Large, Comparable to 
#UL315, 14 mil.12" length. 202 NB UL315XXL

11

Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, 
Medium, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 
12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 
substitutions

4 NB

12

Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, 
Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 
Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 
substitutions

89 NB

13

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-
Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 
Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 
substitutions

608 NB

$13.03

$13.03



Q-16-621
Examination Gloves

Quotes Opened: August 31, 2016

Item Description 
Approx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor
Item #

Vendor
Item #

Unit
Price

SMS Ambassadors 
Corp

Toledo, OH

The Glove Box, Inc.
Charlotte, NC

Unit
Price

Items 1, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, & 19 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.
Items 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6 awarded to J & J Enterprises.

Items 7, 8, 9, 11, 12, & 13 awarded to Airgas USA, LLC.
Item 10 awarded to Mastermans LLP.

14

Microflex Midknight MK296L, Black, 
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 
Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 
no substitutions

102 NB MK296L

15

Microflex Midknight MK296XL, Black, 
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 
X Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 
no substitutions

142 NB MK296XL

16

Apex Pro Powder-Free Nitrile Exam 
Gloves, AP12-1, White exterior, Black 
interior, 2-Ply Techology, Small, length 12 
inches, cuff 4.3 mil, palm 5.8 mil, finger 8.3 
mil, tensile strength 24 Mpa, no 
substitutions

10 NB

17

Apex Pro Powder-Free Nitrile Exam 
Gloves, AP12-1, White exterior, Black 
interior, 2-Ply Techology, Medium, length 
12 inches, cuff 4.3 mil, palm 5.8 mil, finger 
8.3 mil, tensile strength 24 Mpa, no 
substitutions

10 NB

$11.37

$11.37



Q-16-621
Examination Gloves

Quotes Opened: August 31, 2016

Item Description 
Approx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor
Item #

Vendor
Item #

Unit
Price

SMS Ambassadors 
Corp

Toledo, OH

The Glove Box, Inc.
Charlotte, NC

Unit
Price

Items 1, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, & 19 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.
Items 2, 3, 4, 5, & 6 awarded to J & J Enterprises.

Items 7, 8, 9, 11, 12, & 13 awarded to Airgas USA, LLC.
Item 10 awarded to Mastermans LLP.

18

Apex Pro Powder-Free Nitrile Exam 
Gloves, AP12-1, White exterior, Black 
interior, 2-Ply Techology, Large, length 12 
inches, cuff 4.3 mil, palm 5.8 mil, finger 8.3 
mil, tensile strength 24 Mpa, no 
substitutions

10 NB

19

Apex Pro Powder-Free Nitrile Exam 
Gloves, AP12-1, White exterior, Black 
interior, 2-Ply Techology, X Large, length 
12 inches, cuff 4.3 mil, palm 5.8 mil, finger 
8.3 mil, tensile strength 24 Mpa, no 
substitutions

10 NB

Notes:


	Sheet1

