
Q-18-663

Examination Gloves

Item Description

Approx.

Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

1
Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, size Large,  4 mil. 

or County approved equal. 
36 RAD64057707 $3.07 1015-85003 $6.79 752086 $2.58 752086 $2.40 MPR-509-X $2.62

2

Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, size Small,  5 mil. or County 

approved equal.

25 RAD64056426 $6.73 1015-14211 $7.01 752110 $4.15 752110 $3.80 NPFT1020 $3.89

3

Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, size Medium , 5 mil. or 

County approved equal.

60 RAD64056427 $6.73 1015-14212 $7.01 752107 $4.15 752107 $3.80 NPFT1030 $3.89

4

Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, size Large , 5 mil. or 

County approved equal.

110 RAD64056428 $6.73 1015-14213 $7.01 752104 $4.15 $3.80 $3.89 $3.89

5

Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, size X-Large,  5 mil. or 

County approved equal.

143 RAD64056429 $6.73 1015-14214 $7.01 752116 $4.15 752116 $3.80 NPFT1050 $3.89

6

UL315M, Exam glove, size Medium, 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315, Powder-Free, 

Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 

substitutions

160 MCRUL-315-M $10.11 290316 $10.40 777439 $26.40 777439 $24.00 *

7

UL315L, Exam glove, size Large, 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315, Powder-Free, 

Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 

substitutions

40 MCRUL-315-L $10.11 290317 $10.40 777436 $13.20 777436 $24.00 *

8

UL315XL, Exam glove, size X-Large , 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315, Powder-Free, 

Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 

substitutions

140 MCRUL-315-XL $10.11 290318 $10.40 630231 $13.20 630231 $24.00 *

9

Exam glove, size 2X-Large , Comparable to 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315 or County 

approved equal , Powder-Free, Textured 

Fingers, 12" Length

240 MCRLSE-104-XXL $14.27 SY-911XXL $11.12 DCER-5B $17.80 *

10

Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, size 

Medium , Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 

12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

50 S636602-20 $9.99 290912 $11.12 1243 $5.93

Concordance Healthcare 

Solutions, LLC

Tiffin, OH

The Glove Box, Inc. 

Charlotte, NC

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Bound Tree Medical, 

LLC

Dublin, OH

Concordance Healthcare 

Solutions

New Rochelle, NY

No Bid

Unit

Price

Unit

Price

Items 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 13, & 18 to The Glove Box (Pending 

Additional Information)  

Items 6, 7, 8, 10, 11 & 12 to Airgas USA, LLC

Item 9, 14, 15, 16, & 17 to Bound Tree Medical, LLC 

Unit

Price

Unit

Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Unit 

Price

Airgas USA, LLC

Allentown, PA

Quotes Opened: 8-31-2018



Q-18-663

Examination Gloves

Concordance Healthcare 

Solutions, LLC

Tiffin, OH

The Glove Box, Inc. 

Charlotte, NC

Bound Tree Medical, 

LLC

Dublin, OH

Concordance Healthcare 

Solutions

New Rochelle, NY

Unit

Price

Unit

Price

Items 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 13, & 18 to The Glove Box (Pending 

Additional Information)  

Items 6, 7, 8, 10, 11 & 12 to Airgas USA, LLC

Item 9, 14, 15, 16, & 17 to Bound Tree Medical, LLC 

Unit

Price

Unit

Price

Unit 

Price

Airgas USA, LLC

Allentown, PA

Item Description

Approx.

Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

11

Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, size 

Large , Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 

Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

103 S636603-20 $9.99 290913 $11.12 6.13 $6.13

12

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, size 

X-Large , Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 

12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

608 S636604-20 $9.99 290914 $11.12 $6.13 $6.13

13

Exam glove, size 2X-Large , Comparable to 

Thickster Latex 6604-20, Powder-Free, 

Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 

beaded cuff

150 S636605-20 $9.99 SY-911XXL $11.12 $7.98

14

MK296S - Microflex Midknight, Black, 

Powder-Free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

size Small,  Length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil., 

palm 4.7 mil., finger 5.5 mil., tensile 

strength 16, no substitutions

22 MCRMK-296-S $9.52 1015-29601 $6.78 148927 $10.35 148927 $9.46

15

MK296M - Microflex Midknight, Black, 

Powder-Free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

size Medium,  length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil., 

palm 4.7 mil., finger 5.5 mil., tensile 

strength 16, no substitutions

55 MCRMK-296-M $9.52 1015-29602 $6.78 148928 $10.35 148928 $9.46 777-7 $4.85

16

MK296L - Microflex Midknight, Black, 

Powder-Free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

size Large , length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil., 

palm 4.7 mil., finger 5.5 mil., tensile 

strength 16, no substitutions

244 MCRMK-296-L $9.52 1015-29603 $6.78 148930 $10.35 148930 $9.46 777-8 $4.93

17

MK296XL - Microflex Midknight, Black, 

Powder-Free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

size X-Large , length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil., 

palm 4.7 mil., finger 5.5 mil., tensile 

strength 16, no substitutions

265 MCRMK-296-XL $9.52 1015-29604 $6.78 148931 $10.35 148931 $9.46 777-9 $4.93

18

Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile Standard Exam 

Glove, comparable to MK296 - Microflex 

Midnight , size 2X-Large,  length 245 mm, 

cuff 3.1 mil., palm 4.7 mil., finger 5.5 mil., 

tensile strength 16

101 MCRMK-296-XXL $9.52 1015-29605 $6.78 MK-296-XXL $9.46 777-0 $5.93

Item 4 - No Item #

Item 9 - Digitcare ICU911-T.  Glove is packaged 50/Bx - price per 50/Bx is $8.90

The Glove Box, Inc.

Items 4, 11, 12, 13 - No Item #

(4, 11, 12 had price typed in Vendor Item)

ALL GLOVES SHALL BE MEDICAL GRADE 

ORDERS SHALL BE DELIVERED WITHIN SEVENTY-TWO (72) HOURS FROM ORDER PLACEMENT

Concordance Healthcare Solutions LLC

Items 6, 7, 8 - Glove is packaged 50/Bx - price per 50/Bx is $12.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Unit

Price

Unit 

Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Unit

Price

Unit

Price

Unit

Price

Quotes Opened: 8-31-2018



Q-18-663

Examination Gloves

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Usage-

boxes 

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

1
Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, size Large,  4 mil. 

or County approved equal. 
36 2700 $3.44 PVC513 $40.00 No Bid Tradex#VLG200 $2.99 * VPF46100 $3.00

2

Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, size Small,  5 mil. or County 

approved equal.

25 No Bid MDS2094 $60.00 797PF-S $7.70 * Tradex#NSM400 $3.89 * APFN42100 $5.50

3

Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, size Medium , 5 mil. or 

County approved equal.

60 66572 $11.75 MDS2095 $60.00 797PF-M $7.70 * Tradex#NMD400 $3.89 * APFN44100 $5.50

4

Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, size Large , 5 mil. or 

County approved equal.

110 66573 $11.75 MDS2096 $60.00 797PF-L $7.70 * Tradex#NLG400 $3.89 * APFN46100 $5.50

5

Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, size X-Large,  5 mil. or 

County approved equal.

143 66574 $11.75 MDS2097 $60.00 797PF-XL $7.70 * Tradex#NXL400 $3.89 * APFN48100 $5.50

6

UL315M, Exam glove, size Medium, 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315, Powder-Free, 

Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 

substitutions

160 MIC-UL-315-M $12.60 UL-315-M $16.50

7

UL315L, Exam glove, size Large, 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315, Powder-Free, 

Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 

substitutions

40 MIC-UL-315-L $12.60 UL-315-M $16.50

8

UL315XL, Exam glove, size X-Large , 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315, Powder-Free, 

Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 

substitutions

140 MIC-UL-315-XL $12.60 UL-315-M $16.50

9

Exam glove, size 2X-Large , Comparable to 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315 or County 

approved equal , Powder-Free, Textured 

Fingers, 12" Length

240 UL-315-M $16.50

10

Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, size 

Medium , Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 

12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

50 6602-20 $11.95 GPLHD84100 $13.50

Unit 

Price

Unit

Price

Unit

Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Heiston Supply

Martinsburg, WV

Unit 

Price

No Bid

Items 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 13, & 18 to The Glove Box 

(Pending Additional Information)  

Items 6, 7, 8, 10, 11 & 12 to Airgas USA, LLC

Item 9, 14, 15, 16, & 17 to Bound Tree Medical, 

LLC 

Medline Industries, Inc.

Northfield,  IL

PH&S Products

Minerva, OH

Pyramid School Products

Tampa, FL

Sanlou, LLC

Greenbelt,  MD

Unit

Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Quotes Opened: 8-31-2018
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Examination Gloves

Unit 

Price

Unit

Price

Unit

Price

Heiston Supply

Martinsburg, WV

Unit 

Price

Items 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 13, & 18 to The Glove Box 

(Pending Additional Information)  

Items 6, 7, 8, 10, 11 & 12 to Airgas USA, LLC

Item 9, 14, 15, 16, & 17 to Bound Tree Medical, 

LLC 

Medline Industries, Inc.

Northfield,  IL

PH&S Products

Minerva, OH

Pyramid School Products

Tampa, FL

Sanlou, LLC

Greenbelt,  MD

Unit

Price
Item Description

Approx.

Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

11

Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, size 

Large , Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 

Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

103 6603-20 $11.95 GPLHD86100 $13.50

12

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, size 

X-Large , Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 

12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

608 6604-20 $11.95 GPLHD88100 $13.50

13

Exam glove, size 2X-Large , Comparable to 

Thickster Latex 6604-20, Powder-Free, 

Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 

beaded cuff

150 6605-20 $11.95 485605 $95.00 SAS6605-20 $16.50

14

MK296S - Microflex Midknight, Black, 

Powder-Free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

size Small,  Length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil., 

palm 4.7 mil., finger 5.5 mil., tensile 

strength 16, no substitutions

22 MIC-MK-296-S $11.89 Aurelia#73996 $4.69 * ABNPF42100 $6.75

15

MK296M - Microflex Midknight, Black, 

Powder-Free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

size Medium,  length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil., 

palm 4.7 mil., finger 5.5 mil., tensile 

strength 16, no substitutions

55 MIC-UL-296-M $11.89 Aurelia#73997 $4.69 * ABNPF44100 $6.75

16

MK296L - Microflex Midknight, Black, 

Powder-Free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

size Large , length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil., 

palm 4.7 mil., finger 5.5 mil., tensile 

strength 16, no substitutions

244 MIC-UL-296-L $11.89 Aurelia#73998 $4.69 * ABNPF46100 $6.75

17

MK296XL - Microflex Midknight, Black, 

Powder-Free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

size X-Large , length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil., 

palm 4.7 mil., finger 5.5 mil., tensile 

strength 16, no substitutions

265 MIC-UL-296-XL $11.89 Aurelia#73999 $4.69 * ABNPF48100 $6.75

18

Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile Standard Exam 

Glove, comparable to MK296 - Microflex 

Midnight , size 2X-Large,  length 245 mm, 

cuff 3.1 mil., palm 4.7 mil., finger 5.5 mil., 

tensile strength 16

101 MIC-UL-296-XXL $11.89 Aurelia#73990 $4.69 * MK-296 $16.00

PH&S Products Pyramid School Products

Items 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18 - 10 boxes/cs…FULL CASES ONLY

Unit

Price

Unit

Price

Unit 

Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 - Available in Blue or Black

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

ALL GLOVES SHALL BE MEDICAL GRADE 

ORDERS SHALL BE DELIVERED WITHIN SEVENTY-TWO (72) HOURS FROM ORDER PLACEMENT

Unit

Price

Unit 

Price

Quotes Opened: 8-31-2018


