
PUR-1349
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

(Various County Departments)

1 Bids Opened: 05-08-17

Item
No.

Item Description / 
Formulation

Estimated                         
Annual Usage / Case Type

Unit of     
Measure   Per

Unit 
Price Note Unit 

Price Note

1 Acclaim Extra 2-Gallons Gallon $494.00 $465.00

2 Aqua Shade 5 Cases/4 x 1 Gallons
4 Gallons/Case Gallon $39.99 $40.00

3 Propiconazole                                       
14.3%

3 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $48.55 $52.22

4 Propamocarb Hydrochloride
66.2%

8 Cases/2 x 1 Gallons
2 Gallons/Case Gallon $299.00 $300.00

5 Bensumec – 4LF 5 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $119.99 $109.00

6 Thiophonate Methyl
46.2%

40 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $43.14 $44.71

7 Alumimum Tris WDG                    
80%

10 Cases/4 x 5.5 lbs.
22 lb./Case Pound No Bid $13.73

8 Crossbow 15 Gallons/2 x 2.5 Gal. 
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $44.99 $49.00

9 Chlorothanlonil
54% 720 SFT

12 Cases/2 x 2. 5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $31.77 $36.75

10 Chlorpyrifos 4E
42.5%

2 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $48.04 $46.00

11 Dylox 420 SL 4 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $63.37 $62.58

12 Fore WSP 9-Cases/8 x 4 x 1.5 lb.
48 lb./Case Pound $7.40 $7.70

Helena Chemical Co.
New Market, MD

Crop Production Services
Rosedale, MD



PUR-1349
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

(Various County Departments)

2 Bids Opened: 05-08-17

Item
No.

Item Description / 
Formulation

Estimated                         
Annual Usage / Case Type

Unit of     
Measure   Per

Unit 
Price Note Unit 

Price Note

13 Head Way 4-Cases/2 x 1 Gallons 
2 Gallons/Case Gallon $417.00 $417.00

14 Tebuconazole
38.7%

23-Gallons/4 x 1 Gallons
5 3/4 Gallons/Case Gallon $44.40 $47.00

15 Imidacloprid                                 
75% 2-Cases/88x 1.6 oz Case Case $298.65 $352.00

16 PCNB                                             
40%

6-Cases/2x2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $52.22 $52.22

17 Pendulum Aqua Cap 6-Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $44.99 $54.00

18 Trinexapac – Ethyl 
11.3%

2-Cases/2 x 2.5Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $119.00 $104.44

19 Prograss 9-Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $123.75 $135.25

20 Provaunt 2-Cases
8 x 10oz. Case $499.40 $672.00 *

21 Glyphosate                                     
41%

4-Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $11.99 $14.50

22 Mefenoxam 
22.5%

2.5 Cases/2x1 Case
2 Gallon Cases Gallon $373.33 $335.15

23 Talstar 4 x 1-Gallons
4 Gallons/Case Gallon $32.93 $33.00

24 Trimec Classic 20-Gallons/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $21.20 $35.53

Crop Production Services
Rosedale, MD

Helena Chemical Co.
New Market, MD



PUR-1349
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

(Various County Departments)

3 Bids Opened: 05-08-17

Item
No.

Item Description / 
Formulation

Estimated                         
Annual Usage / Case Type

Unit of     
Measure   Per

Unit 
Price Note Unit 

Price Note

25 Paclobutrazol
22.3%

3-Gallons
2 x 1 Gallon Cases Gallon $189.90 $152.00

26 Phosguard 200-Gallons
2 x 2.5 Gallon Cases Gallon $1,697.00 No Bid

NOTES:
Helena Chemical Co. - 
 #20 - Quoted 8 x 12 oz. Case

SiteOne Landscape Supply - 
All alternate brands written under description, labels/specs enclosed.

#3 Spectator Ultra 1.3
#6 Lesco T-Storm
#7 Fosetyl-Al
#8 Candor
#9 ManicureleFL
#13 (Agency)
#15 Lesco Bandit 75WSP (5x4x4x1.6oz/case)
#16 Turfcide
#18 T-Nex Par
#21 Prosecutor Pro
#25 Tide Paclo
#26 LESCO Green Flo Phyte

Crop Production Services
Rosedale, MD

Helena Chemical Co.
New Market, MD



PUR-1349
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

(Various County Departments)

4 Bids Opened: 05-08-17

Item
No.

Item Description / 
Formulation

Estimated                         
Annual Usage / Case Type

Unit of     
Measure   Per

Unit 
Price Note Unit 

Price Note

1 Acclaim Extra 2-Gallons Gallon $465.00 $525.00

2 Aqua Shade 5 Cases/4 x 1 Gallons
4 Gallons/Case Gallon $40.38 $38.48

3 Propiconazole                                       
14.3%

3 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $67.00 $52.00 *

4 Propamocarb Hydrochloride
66.2%

8 Cases/2 x 1 Gallons
2 Gallons/Case Gallon $304.00 No Bid

5 Bensumec – 4LF 5 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $104.00 $124.00

6 Thiophonate Methyl
46.2%

40 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $53.00 $45.00 *

7 Alumimum Tris WDG                    
80%

10 Cases/4 x 5.5 lbs.
22 lb./Case Pound $13.42 $16.03 *

8 Crossbow 15 Gallons/2 x 2.5 Gal. 
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $45.24 $46.34 *

9 Chlorothanlonil
54% 720 SFT

12 Cases/2 x 2. 5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $28.90 $38.00 *

10 Chlorpyrifos 4E
42.5%

2 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $50.00 $60.13

11 Dylox 420 SL 4 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $60.00 $70.00

12 Fore WSP 9-Cases/8 x 4 x 1.5 lb.
48 lb./Case Pound $7.25 $8.51

Landscape Supply
Upper Marlboro, MD

SiteOne Landscape
Supply

Cleveland, OH



PUR-1349
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

(Various County Departments)

5 Bids Opened: 05-08-17

Item
No.

Item Description / 
Formulation

Estimated                         
Annual Usage / Case Type

Unit of     
Measure   Per

Unit 
Price Note Unit 

Price Note

13 Head Way 4-Cases/2 x 1 Gallons 
2 Gallons/Case Gallon $417.00 $417.00 *

14 Tebuconazole
38.7%

23-Gallons/4 x 1 Gallons
5 3/4 Gallons/Case Gallon $46.50 $60.00

15 Imidacloprid                                 
75% 2-Cases/88x 1.6 oz Case Case $281.00 $315.80 *

16 PCNB                                             
40%

6-Cases/2x2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $65.00 $48.95 *

17 Pendulum Aqua Cap 6-Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $48.00 $65.38

18 Trinexapac – Ethyl 
11.3%

2-Cases/2 x 2.5Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $102.00 $136.34 *

19 Prograss 9-Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $140.00 $152.50

20 Provaunt 2-Cases
8 x 10oz. Case $662.40 $504.00

21 Glyphosate                                     
41%

4-Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $15.00 $20.00 *

22 Mefenoxam 
22.5%

2.5 Cases/2x1 Case
2 Gallon Cases Gallon $329.00 $390.85

23 Talstar 4 x 1-Gallons
4 Gallons/Case Gallon $35.00 $38.30

24 Trimec Classic 20-Gallons/2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Gallons/Case Gallon $39.00 $41.00

Landscape Supply
Upper Marlboro, MD

SiteOne Landscape
Supply

Cleveland, OH



PUR-1349
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

(Various County Departments)

6 Bids Opened: 05-08-17

Item
No.

Item Description / 
Formulation

Estimated                         
Annual Usage / Case Type

Unit of     
Measure   Per

Unit 
Price Note Unit 

Price Note

25 Paclobutrazol
22.3%

3-Gallons
2 x 1 Gallon Cases Gallon $149.00 $190.00 *

26 Phosguard 200-Gallons
2 x 2.5 Gallon Cases Gallon No Bid $21.20 *

NOTES:
Helena Chemical Co. - 
 #20 - Quoted 8 x 12 oz. Case

SiteOne Landscape Supply - 
All alternate brands written under description, labels/specs enclosed.

#3 Spectator Ultra 1.3
#6 Lesco T-Storm
#7 Fosetyl-Al
#8 Candor
#9 ManicureleFL
#13 (Agency)
#15 Lesco Bandit 75WSP (5x4x4x1.6oz/case)
#16 Turfcide
#18 T-Nex Par
#21 Prosecutor Pro
#25 Tide Paclo
#26 LESCO Green Flo Phyte

Landscape Supply
Upper Marlboro, MD

SiteOne Landscape
Supply

Cleveland, OH
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